Approved by CC:
SEP 0.8 2014

REQUEST FOR AGENDA PLACEMENT
Submission Deadline - Tuesday, 12:00 PM before Court Dates

SUBMITTED BY: Raiph McBroom
TODAY'S DATE: September 2, 2014

DEPARTMENT: PURCHASING
SIGNATURE OF DEPARTMENT HEAD:  Ralph McBroom

REQUESTED AGENDA DATE: September 8, 2014

CAG (0) G: Request court review and approve RFB#2014-418
Road Materials to all vendors.

PERSON(S) TO PRESENT ITEM: Ralph McBroom
SUPPORT MATERIAL: Under LGC 262.027 (¢) and see attached.

TIME: S minutes ACTIONITEM: __ X

WORKSHOP
(Anticipated number of minutes needed to discuss item) CONSENT:

EXECUTIVE:

SIAFF NOTICE:

COUNTY ATTORNEY: X IT DEPARTMENT:

AUDITOR: PURCHASING DEPARTMENT:

PERSONNEL: PUBLIC WORKS:

BUDGET COORDINATOR: OTHER: Commissioners (4)

seseasensna*This Section t0 be completed by County Judge’s Office®#*sw#swsns

ASSIGNED AGENDA DATE:
REQUEST RECEIVED BY COUNTY JUDGE'S OFFICE

§COURT MEMBER APPROVAL Date




Approved by CC:
RFB 2014-418: Road Materials PP
SEP 08 2014
Opening Date: August 21, 2014 2:00 p.m at Johnson County Purchasing Office
Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
FortWorth | Arnold Crished Vuican ingram
Vendor Crushed Stone Stone Apac-Texas Inc Materials Martin Marietta | Rattler Rock | Squaw Creek Material Trinity Materials
Pickup | FOB jrickUp| FOB |PickUp | FOB JPickUp] FOB | Pickup | FOB |[PickUp| FOB |PickUp| FOB Pickup| FoB |[Pickup] FOB
Hot Mix{334) TypeF | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | awne | * |$85.00] $0.25 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Hot Mix Type AC1.5 | NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | NoBid | menss | * |$85.00] $0.25 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid| No Bid | No Bid | No 8id
HMAC (340) Type 8 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid [ssswsam| * |$75.00] $0.33 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
HMAC (340) TypeD | NoBld | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid Es_..a. » | $75.00] $0.33 | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid| No 8id | No Bid | No Bid
Riprap, TypeR432 | ¢41 g0 [ NOBId| your | NoBid | NoBid |No Bid] No Bid | No Bid |$1500cte] No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | o Bid | No Bid| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
~STEOr
Riprap, Type 432 | NoBid | NoBid| tomr [ No8id | NoBid |No Bid] No Bid | No Bid| No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid| No Bid | No Bid | No 8id
Surf Agg, Type A Grade 4 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid |No Bid] $18.00] $0.25 | No Bid | NoBid | NoBid | No Bid | NoBid | NoB8id] teseee | * | No Bid | No Bid
Surf Agg, Type A Grade 5| No 8id | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid |No Bid| $8.50 | $0.25 | No Bid | NoBid | No 8id | No Bid| No Bid | No 8id | No Bid] No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Surf Agg, Type B Grade 4 | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No 8id | No Bid [No 8id] $18.00] $0.25 | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid] No Bid | No 8id | No Bid
Surf Agg, Type B Grade S | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid |No Bid| $8.50 | $0.25 | NoBid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid | No Bid } No Bid | No Bid| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
3/8" Pea Gravel | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid] No Bid zouaﬁﬁjzoza No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No8id [$12.00]  * | $8.00 | No Bid
S:Bz.a_vw%ssez. NoBid | NoBid | No8id | No Bid | Nosid |Noeid| No Bid | No 8id| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid | No Bid| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Weathered Line Kitn Dust] No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |No Bid| No Bid | NoBid] No 8id | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Concrete Sand No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid |No Bid| $8.00 | $0.25 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | $7.00 | $0.25 |$14.00] * | $15.00] No Bid
Prot Type /I No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |No Bid| No8id |No8id| == | $0.40] No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid] No Bid | No 8id | No Bid
z&.._n%aﬂ_hnag usscemn| no Big | $4.95 | NoBid | No Bid |No Bid] $7.50 | $0.25 | ssoocnen | NoBid | $5.25 | No Bid [***2™*| $0.25 | No Bid| No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
X,
Fleible 3258, 4em 247 | weswios | No i | $4.95 | No Bid | NoBid |No Bid] $7.50 | $0.25 | sesocnes | NoBid | No Bid | No mid "™} $0.25 [No eid] No 8id | No Bid | No i
ai%mﬂﬂwﬁg NoBid | NoBid| $4.95 | NoBid | NoBid |No 8id] NoBid | Nosid| NoBid | No eid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid] No 8id | No Bid | No Bid
Coated Rock PB3 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid| $45.00] $0.25 | No Bid | No 8id | No 8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid] No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Coated Rock PB4 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |No Bid] $45.00] $0.25 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid | No 8id | No Bid] No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
High Perfo e
_39__;”_”38 NoBid | NoBid| NoBid | NoBid | avnde | * | NoBid |NoBid| NoBid | NoBid | No 8id | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid| No 8id | No Bid | No Bid
1 oG
Minimum Order, 23Tonsfor Na Min . Also have 33°-5" over
*1-10 Miles $5.00 per $30000A0sd ¥ >
Other Fees ton. add $0.30 2 ton for spreader ber s desired on
oath sdditions] mile comant delivacies




